I 4. ST.u.- 33004/99 REGD. No. D. L.-33004/99

Che Gazette of India

I1.57.-31.Tel.-31.-11102023-249315
CG-DL-E-11102023-249315

ETETIOT
EXTRAORDINARY
AT |—Eve 3—39-T7E (i)
PART I1—Section 3—Sub-section (i)

grfee T THfAT
PUBLISHED BY AUTHORITY

. 580] TE feef, TEATT, FERGET 11, 2023/ 19, 1945
No. 580] NEW DELHI, WEDNESDAY, OCTOBER 11, 2023/ASVINA 19, 1945

CINESELIGE R EIEE

CIPECET
e faeetY, 10 srFqae, 2023

arar@. 733(31).— FrgEE [, 1937 &7 3w dengd w & forw wfaay [ast w1 9,
ATLAT ATATAH, 1934 (1934 FT 22) i &T=T 14 FIRT TATITEAT, FT & TSI, FHTLTIT, 90 I, T 3,
STEE (i) # 9r#L.M. 520(3), aE 6 JATE, 2022 3T ALFALE. 812(3), aiE 9 qda, 2022 FRT
TERTTT TRt ITT o, oreer 3T =98 YA gid arel a7 SRdl & a7 oY g=11a 39 arie 9, 99
IF ATEEAT AT TSI T TTAAT STAAT T ITAsd FT & T2 off, d19 At v srafey 6 gty 9 @
A fohw T o ;

3T I WTET T TS0 | w9, AR 6 AT, 2022 ¥ 9 q94aY, 2022 FT THIAT T T7

T

3T, 36 ITeT AFAT % gag # fAfAfae s@ter & e S9ar 7 9 e S g 9w @=n #7
IERIRIE A

6425 G1/2023 @)



2 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

A, A, FAF TR, ATLAT ATAFH, 1934 (1934 FT 22) HT &T=T 4, g7 5 3 o7 10F
BT Y& QTR T ST ¥ gU, aTAT I, 1937 &7 $i¥ Hee Fi & fory Fafatead Haa aqmdr
g, oA -

1. FTerE AT S YRH--(1) =7 =t &7 Sfer am argame (v "eree) e, 2023 §
(2) T TSI § TR THTIA AT T 7 T9 g |
2. araTe fAm, 1937 (59 =0¢ =oe TTq 3<% a9 Fgr 17 8) & a9 13 #,--

i. ‘TR AT oreal ® T U, SEl Fel o oOd 8, ‘e Fume aerReareT
BT SAATHTH AT & 9158 T S0 ;

ii. “frfae Fame fFramr asai F wore o7, “ffEe Bame qgiReere aes T ST |
3. 3<% fo=Hi 9, (97w 38 % 3at=aw (1) #,-
(i) @< (1) % = ox, el @ war sroa, seriq -
“(3T) IETT A2 er® LT (BT i 2ettwreat % frm);
(ii) @< (=) F = o Muferfad @< w@r ST, i -

‘(@) IR AqATH (AT, S9Al, ARAAEe argde, dEe e FgA i)
ST & form); 7|

4. 3% = o, R 397 = sufa=m (1) Fr ot & --
(i) 77 FE=AT (i) & T8 T (3) |, I a9 9qSa1 o €I 9T, “TH I 051 TG ST ;

(ii) 79 AT (i) F AT T (3) |, “TTF AU A& 6 €9 UL, “TH AU 9751 T SATUA |

5. 3 AT ®, e 42 % 3ufaaw (1) F =19 wqs & ganq Metied wgs saertug B s,
AT i~

“qiq T8 AT o AEIaer® g TeTafaias T a1 Sqara & [Eerurieshl 1 T3 Fi & o
TEAAT AT Tl &1 o S hT STULATT FATRAT, ST FT THET o6 TR0 % T T AT S{T0AT”

6. 3<% f=wt & W 66 #,--
(i) ECICRET (1) H -

() ST 927§, “ToRelt weTer” ereal o T Y, “TeRET SaTer, T ST ATeed #sed,
eI ed, ISTY Tah1eT AT FlS 37 TR Aled, TF ol GHT Ael & 058 T S0 ;

(@) @< (F) |, “5 e o 37 o153 & T I, “IiF qa I &g T S0
(1) BT () , “GHIT” 9EaT F TATT UL, “I7F T HIA F THIT 9068 T S0 ;
() @@= () F T MHfered @< sia:earaa BT ST, J9iq -

“(3T) ST ATLAT o FLIETT THATA 0 AT(T FT T AT QA= T B TATAT FlA H
HohT IAH T T |




[¢TT 1l—=ve 3(i)] T T TSI © T 3

(37) 38 TR AT G () F TAT " GI<h F S 92 [Aeferfad i qi<e aemaa s
ST, e i

“HETT LRI T I GILT TTTErhd Fle SATh T § ATAG=AT FIRT IH TATF % TTHT 7 IHh

TATT UT TR L@ ATl SATh I STgl TR1eT TETAT AT STTaT g AT T/ 9 TAX T a1 AR I8
TATHY AT SAT<h FT HI0 IT T TR AT H THTLT T AT T THATAT &7 I ST g a=qT Fiaey § fheft
AT FHTT T F VI Hl T g THATET ST e o [T T HST T 1)

(ii) Sufe=w (3) #, “IFT gqF® & d9a 7, B arfed F2d & 9 I 92 RN, FI4T § sfafag
TA3eTt &7 SAqITAT T |7 9TeaT o T I, S AT | dA [een F SIqae T w1 F30T 17971
T SO |

(iii) SITH=H (4) F T 9 Mo SURTw T@r S, S -

“(4) Tt TATHT AT AT, SH TH9r FA F1 [aor &A1 W7 §, F 9 UH TR K AAE AT
IRIh FTI0T € 1 I8 THIOT FTd 6 T HT AL 39 T N, qg IT TH1 H AT T T2 Hl a2
A & THT, 2ATS AT AT & fAaert it srfrer fAfaer fowme war s it aeqd F |

(5) =tz #rs Y 37 ==feE, | aw =8 e & aefie gEer & arfie & 7 g, 7 S g fr

ST T AT H A0 THT9T AT AT TATAT T H Tl FLed 6l SUEAT FIAT & T bl d TLH1E AT Fmid
AYEH T ATAFHT Hls Ah &A1 AAELTF THAT U I T qF Tgaad 36 TH H A AT

TRATT ST ATEATT &2 GIar T &Ter 281 AT &7 283 AT ZAT o 12N TILTer A FiTeA T FILATS TKA
T g HaG qIord T2 & ATH it e o w7 7o |

(6) Tfe FoRET fAWTe ATersh o GTET WRTST o ©TT T TqT Jgi o7 ST qohal & IT UE TR1eT T
SUTRT AT T H A5l & AT THT HT IcaSid Sq Uk T H L T I T 2l W@T g,
TATRAT, gaTe AT MY AT TATATSH ATT¥eY HIHA &l Qd dag e weod | fae wan e

FIA AU g ATLAT & Higar ®l &=T 281 AT =T 283 AT TAT *F A I FIA FA &q
FLATE TTEH AT AT T 1”

7. 3 et #, M= 67% ¥, IUMEH (6) ¥ AW o751 & T 9, “ATYAT €51 T@T SITUAT |
8. 3= Aawit , Faw 118 =1 =9 T st |
9. I =T, SIqg=T 2 H,--
(i) STTATT & ofiv & orefl=, 27 9 &1 9T 10 F =T § [ H&ATTohd [ IT ST
(ii) TTATT T ofidF = o717 TT 4 ¥, @ (M) F ¥ 9 FAforiad @ T@r ST, 72 -
“(T) IoERT TFET- IoeeR TET UHR ATEA aREEd G SIS A g S ZH ey
FE AT STEHT LT AT Al T SITUIAT, TATTT ITEHRT LT TAEAT 2 & AN 7 § AHAEE
STUEATAT o SITATT AAF ol SITUIAT 17|
10. 3 AIHT #, gl 3 #, AN & H, I 8 § ©T (F) F TAT MHAI&d I s erraa &ar
STTUT, e i

‘I AT AIITH AT TerT 37 At st & 0 Qg a1 TRIAAT STTerslt i 20 Tgi (6T
ST |eh 1 ATATHETIE I ST RATT AI2d IAqH I8 He % TH a1 T8 [ FIA gl [oreeh




4 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

AT U T AFATH TT FA 6 o T AT Aterhaq a6 QA1 gq da@ e & o fere
e |l AT 20T 1

11. 3<% AT H, =T 6@ H 927 2 |, q720it 2 |, w7 §&qiF 81 & A8, &0 (2) |, “SuUHIq” e &
T AT ST |

[®T. &. T4l - 11012/1/2022-31<1]
qAwg T 7T, T at=a

feroqor— wer R e & Tt # srfag=ET ger 9126, fRAiE 23 914, 1937 F agd whfea fhw
A AW aT S{r.uH.ae 289(3), AT 08 3rier, 2022 F dgd "enfad U T0 F ud 9d *
TSI, AFTATL, 907 |, &2 3, 39w (i), faeiw 08 31er, 2022 § warrfara farm o)

MINISTRY OF CIVIL AVIATION
NOTIFICATION
New Delhi, the 10th October, 2023

G.S.R. 733(E).—Whereas, the draft of certain rules further to amend the Aircraft Rules, 1937, was published
as required under section 14 of the Aircraft Act, 1934 (22 of 1934) in the notification of the Government of India, in
the Ministry of Civil Aviation, vide number G.S.R. 520 (E), dated the 06th July, 2022 and G.S.R. 812 (E), dated the
09th November, 2022, in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part Il, Section 3, Sub-section (i), inviting objections
and suggestions from all persons likely to be affected thereby, before the expiry of the period of thirty days from the
date of publication in the Official Gazette and containing the said notification were made available to public;

And whereas, the said draft rules were published in the Official Gazette on dated the 06th July, 2022 and
09th November, 2022 respectively;

And whereas, the objections and suggestions received from the public in respect of the said draft rules within
the period specified, have been taken into consideration;

Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers conferred by sections 4, 5 and 10A of the Aircraft Act, 1934 (22 of
1934), the Central Government hereby makes the following rules further to amend the Aircraft Rules, 1937; namely: -

1. Short title and commencement. — (1) These rules may be called the Aircraft (First Amendment) Rules, 2023.
(2)  They shall come into force on the date of its publication in the Official Gazette.
2. In the Aircraft Rules, 1937 (hereinafter referred to as the said rules), in rule 13,—

i. for the words “Government Aerodrome” wherever they occur, the words “Aerodrome licensed by
the Director-General of Civil Aviation” shall be substituted;

ii. for the words “Civil Aviation Department”, the words “Directorate General of Civil Aviation”
shall be substituted.

3. In the said rules, in rule 38, in sub-rule (1), —
(i) for clause (h), the following clause shall be substituted, namely: —
“(h) Flight Instructor’s Rating (for aeroplanes, helicopters);”;
(ii) for clause (i), the following clause shall be substituted, namely:—
“(1) Pilot’s License (for gliders, balloons, microlight aircraft, light sport aircraft and gyroplane);”.
4. In the said rules, in rule 39C, in sub-rule (1), in the Table, —

(i) against serial number (i), in column (3), for the words “Five years” the words “Ten years” shall
be substituted;



[#T T H—=ve 3(i)] T T TSI © T 5

(i1) against serial number (ii), in column (3), for the words “Five years” the words “Ten years”
shall be substituted.

5. Inthe said rules, in rule 42, in sub-rule (1), after fourth proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, namely: —

“Provided also that the requirements of competency and recent experience for exercising the
privileges of the licence or rating as specified by the Director-General, shall be completed before
renewal of licence or rating as the case may be.”.

6. In the said rules, in rule 66,—
(i) in sub-rule (1), —

(@) in the opening paragraph, for the words “any light”, the words “any light including but not
limited to the lights from Lantern Kites, Wish Kites, Laser light or any other light” shall be
substituted;

(b)  in clause (a) , for the figure and word “5 kilometres,” the words “five nautical miles,” shall be
substituted;

(© in clause (c) , for the word “vicinity” the words “vicinity of five nautical miles” shall be
substituted;

(d) after clause (d), the following clause shall be inserted, namely: —

“(e) which may disrupt safe operation of the aircraft or may pose hazard to the operating
crew.”;

(e) after clause () as so inserted, for the long line, the following long line shall be substituted,
namely: —

“the Central Government. or any person authorised by it may by notification in Official
Gazette, serve a notice upon the owner or person in possession of the place where the light is
exhibited or upon the person having charge of the light, directing the owner or person to take
effectual means for extinguishing or for effectually screening the light with immediate effect
and for preventing for the future, the exhibition of any similar light.”;

(it)  in sub-rule (3), for the words “ in the absence of reasonable cause, the burden of proving which
shall be upon him, comply with the direction contained in the notice.” the words “
immediately act in accordance with the directions contained in the said notice.” shall be
substituted;

(iii)  for the sub-rule (4), the following sub-rules shall be substituted, namely:—

“(4) In case the owner or person who has been directed to extinguish the light has any reasonable
cause to operate such light, the burden of proof which shall be upon him, may, after
extinguishing or stopping exhibition of lights, submit an appeal from the directions of Airport
Operator, to the Director General of Civil Aviation.

(5) If any owner or person on whom a notice under this rule is served, neglects for a period of twenty
four hours to extinguish or effectually to screen the light mentioned in the notice, the Central
Government or any person authorised by the Central Government may enter upon the place
where the light is and forthwith extinguish the same, doing no unnecessary damage and may
also report the matter to the concerned police station for initiating the action of commission of
offence as provided under section 281 or 283 or both of the Indian Penal Code.

(6) In case the source of the light observed by the operating crew of any aircraft is not located or the
use of such light is not from a determined place or the source of emission of light is shifting
from one place to another then the Airport Operator or the Airline Operator as the case may
be, shall immediately report the matter to the concerned police station so as to initiate action
for commission of offence as provided under section 281 or 283 or both of the Indian Penal

Code.”.
7. In the said rules, in rule 67A, in sub-rule (6), for the word “aeroplane”, the word “aircraft”, shall be substituted.
8. In the said rules, rule 118 shall be omitted.
9. In the said rules, in Schedule Il,—

(i) under the heading Section A, the paragraph 9, shall be renumbered as paragraph 10;



6 THE GAZETTE OF INDIA : EXTRAORDINARY [PART II—SEC. 3(i)]

(i) under the heading Section M, in paragraph 4, for clause (c),the following clause shall
be substituted, namely: —

“(c) Instrument Rating- The Instrument rating shall be part of the Airline Transport Pilot
License and therefore no separate Instrument Rating shall be issued, however, the Instrument
Rating shall be renewed as per the requirements specified in Section ‘O’ of Schedule 11.”.

10. In the said rules, in Schedule 11, in Section A, in paragraph 8, after clause (a), the following proviso shall be
inserted, namely: —

“provided that in case the recency or competency requirements cannot be completed due to insufficient
movements or watch hours then the license holder shall complete minimum ten hours of simulated exercises
including emergencies and shall also undergo a skill assessment for respective rating in not more than ten
consecutive days of commencement of simulated exercises”.

11. Inthe said rules, in Schedule VIB, in paragraph 2, in Table 2, against serial number 81, in column (2), the words
“sub-rule” shall be omitted.

[F. No. AV-11012/1/2022-D G]
SATYENDRA KUMAR MISHRA, Jt. Secy.

Note.— The principal rules were published in the Gazette of India, vide notification number V-26, dated the 23rd
March, 1937 and last amended vide G.S.R. 289(E), dated the 08th April, 2022 published in the Gazette of
India, Extraordinary, Part I, Section 3, Sub-section (i), dated the 08th April, 2022.

Uploaded by Dte. of Printing at Government of India Press, Ring Road, Mayapuri, New Delhi-110064
and Published by the Controller of Publications, Delhi-110054. wo;

KUMAR VERMA




		2023-10-11T21:48:31+0530
	MANOJ KUMAR VERMA




